TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

MR £ O34

Che Gazette of India

Gr.50.-31.Ue.-31.-24102025-267118
CG-DL-E-24102025-267118

STTHTIT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT II—ETE 3—39-99% (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

H. 696] TE fRoeft, AR, SRS 24, 2025/FTHF 2, 1947
No. 696] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, OCTOBER 24, 2025/KARTIKA 2, 1947

CIE R EIS D]
1L
e faeelt, 23 srqaY, 2025

qT.H1.17.780(3).—FT TeTe, @ < giasr (e i fAfHeme) sfafaaw, 1957 (1957 #1

67) T GaTT O HT IT-GTT (2), (3) ¥ (4) TAT gTT 13 FIRT TG ATHRIT T TN FId g, ST Giers
Grst =19 (79, 2015 7 3T Gerge F & forg Feforfag e a=mr g, g —

1. (1) = et =t gferg am T i g = ("@ara) [aw, 2025 21
(2) T TSI § 3ok THTA T TG T T vl

2. T G @i = [, 2015 (B9 =896 =096 747q 'S ({98 &gr @7 §) & [98 1 % 39-
e (1) @, TP G i A" 9Teal F T U, " gies 9ie S A = ores T ST

3. 3<% o=t & = 2 &% 3o (1) §,—

(F) @ (@), (T) AT (F) ¥, YT GiAST G 19" A&l % 1 9L, TG el i 07
T = 9reg @ SO,

(@) @ () F T4, Fofed @< sq:ema T ST, saiq—

"(3TF) "AqAE A" KT Fgr A AT S AU & @A (s s fafaeme) srferfa=m, 2002
(2003 T 17) #¥ 91T 4 F @< (2) F Aefi afvafoe ; &

7095 GI1/2025 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

4. 3 R & Rew 6 §,—

(F) S9-FFaw (1) ¥, “TPT GfAS @i A7 a1 F T UL, TP giae @i i e =
9Te T ST

(@) 39-fF=+ (3) #, —
(i) “TT gfdera” ersai % T 9T, “Ai7 qidera” ereg T SATu;
(ii) “qEAT AT TA-H-@A T8 951 & T UL “qHHd AT 9158 TG ST,

(M) Su-fTw (4) €, ‘=R i [ F el ey e foega @ s getaa e &
e mfart o forg eft s foeqa @rer 3 & |1 ersat &7 o9 R Srosm)

5. 3 A=t % e 7 % so-fem (1) 7 —
(F) “TALTT AATH-T-@A Tg1” TRl F T T2 “GHHT A8 T8 TG AT,
(@) “T Tfqerd” ereat o T 9T “TIT FTaera” 90e8 T S0

6. 3<% ot # fA9w 8 3 v W= fwferfara M T s, st —

“8. HIEATAT.— ~ITH HT FATAT 7% {aoetl § IT U 7 9 9 Roa R St & wrderr afafa
FTT g B ST |61

7. 36 et & s 9 % su-faew (1) §,—
() TTETS AT o I X A ted 1 T ST, i -

"ITE T 32T AT & HIAY, AT &= qid, ¥ 9Id & a1g< Gl AT @ISl & &= ua
fOeqa @I &Y fAshTe & SIS0 & o =79 7 TEd Wit F7 IR FAT1 R, 7 T8 UH
TRATERATTT T T ST ATHT T 3TRT 9 3291 1 TR F2d §T ITH e o o7 a9aqF
AT ST T

(@) ©< (F) H, 953 ‘S % TAT “HEa 0l AT ATHF G I1” 9768 T AT,
() FE () §, “qeq0T AT §” 9real 1 rq AT S,

() @< () H, “3T AT WA F A0 a1 HT AT 647 ST,

(¥) @< () ¥, 9187 “T” T AT AT ATOT;

(F) @< () F TETq, FHEfred g siq:emaa By ST, seri;-

“(5T) TET AEA@IU GiAST WO % Seedl 3T ThiAl A AT VI HIAT ST IAH
T AT, SEH A gl @i Tau, 9T & a8 Giel harmardi &
TETAAT T&TH Fe AT, FaefT &1 ol @it qauite 7 S| Fadst a7 &

(7)) @A, THERLIT, TR, AR AFEAAT, SRR S9a ¥ @1 o | gated
v TRATRATAT T FEAT Y& FTAT ¥ IAFT [Aqarw; i,

(®) @ (2) H, “areq §” oreal F7 A B S

[T, &, TH.VI/8/2025-&T VI]

farer 91ge, "< a=a

fequr—ga a9 F 9, 9T, 9N 0, @ 3, SUEc (i) § Aeaid anEn|. 623(3)
AT 14 3v1ea, 2015 F727 YT FohU 0 o 3fi¥ "t 7,77, /7. 208(3) fa=is 7 774, 2018
grrraenfea o o o



[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 3

MINISTRY OF MINES
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 23rd October, 2025

G.S.R. 780(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-sections (2), (3) and (4) of section 9C and
section 13 of the Mines and Minerals (Development and Regulation) Act, 1957 (67 of 1957), the Central Government
hereby makes the following rules further to amend the National Mineral Exploration Trust Rules, 2015, namely:—

1. (1) These rules may be called the National Mineral Exploration Trust (Amendment) Rules, 2025.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the National Mineral Exploration Trust Rules, 2015 (hereinafter referred to as the ‘said rules’), in rule 1, in sub-
rule (1), for the words ‘“National Mineral Exploration Trust”, the words “National Mineral Exploration and
Development Trust” shall be substituted.

3. In the said rules, in rule 2, in sub-rule (1),—

(a) in clauses (b), (c) and (j), for the words “National Mineral Exploration Trust”, the words ‘“National
Mineral Exploration and Development Trust” shall be substituted,;

(b) in clause (i), the word “and” shall be omitted;
(c) after clause (i), the following clause shall be inserted, namely—

‘(ia) “Offshore areas” shall have the same meaning as defined in clause (n) of section 4 of the Offshore
Areas Mineral (Development and Regulation) Act, 2002 (17 of 2003); and’

4. In the said rules, in rule 6,—

(a) in sub-rule (1), for the words “National Mineral Exploration Trust”, the words ‘“National Mineral
Exploration and Development Trust” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (3),—
(i) for the words “two percent”, the words “three percent” shall be substituted;

(i) for the words “prospective license-cum-mining lease”, the words “composite licence” shall be
substituted;

(c) in sub-rule (4), the words “, including carrying out regional and detailed exploration for minerals under
the scheme, namely, ‘Regional and detailed exploration and related activities under Fund’” shall be omitted.

5. In the said rules, in rule 7, in sub-rule (1),—
(a) for the words “prospecting license-cum-mining lease”, the words “composite licence” shall be substituted;
(b) for the words “two percent”, the words “three percent” shall be substituted.

6. In the said rules, for rule 8, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:—

“8. Office.— The office of the Trust shall be situated at New Delhi or at such other place as may be
determined by the Executive Committee.”.

7. In the said rules, in rule 9, in sub-rule (1),—
(a) for the opening paragraph, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“The object of the Trust shall be to use the funds accrued to the Trust within India, including the
offshore areas, and outside India for the purposes of regional and detailed exploration and development
of mines and minerals, and it shall undertake such activities as may be deemed necessary by the
Governing Body to achieve its objects, including”;

(b) in clause (a), after the word “refine”, the words “critical and strategic minerals or” shall be inserted;
(c) in clause (g), the words “across India” shall be omitted;

(d) in clause (h), the words “and rest of India” shall be omitted;

(e) in clause (j), the word “and” shall be omitted;

(f) after clause (j), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ja) supporting and funding the objectives and schemes of the National Critical Mineral Mission,
including domestic critical mineral exploration, support of exploration activities outside India, risk
coverage of foreign sourcing and mineral recovery;



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(jb) supporting and funding of mining, processing, beneficiation, evacuation infrastructure, technology
upgradation, and other activities related to mine development; and”;

(g) in clause (k), the words “of India” shall be omitted.
[F. No. M.V1/8/2025-Mines VI]
DINESH MAHUR, Jt. Secy.

Note.— The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i),
vide number G.S.R. 623(E), dated the 14™ August, 2015 and was amended, vide number G.S.R. 208(E), dated
the 7t March, 2018.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. i




